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In "Assault at West Point", John F. Marszalek, the highly acclaimed author of "Sherman: A Soldier's Passion
for Order", has written a dramatic account of one of the most momentous trials in American history. Set in
the 1880s, this riveting story focuses on Whittaker, a former slave who became the third black to enter West
Point. Like his two predecessors, he was ostracized for the entire three years of his training. One morning
Whittaker didn't show up for drill. He was found in his room, unconscious, tied tightly to the bed, with blood
streaming from his head. In a trial that received major attention from the press, Whittaker was accused of
faking the crime to get sympathy from the public and from his professors. Author Marszalek weaves his rich
narrative from historical records to tell how Whittaker sought justice against all odds. Now the basis if the
Showtime original movie "Assault at West Point", this compelling work brings to life a case that rocked the
country and involved the highest reaches of power-- and vividly demonstrates the impact of racism on teh
fabric of American society.
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Browning:

The reserve with title Assault at West Point, the Court Martial of Johnson Whittaker contains a lot of
information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This particular book
exist new expertise the information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world now. That
is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you throughout
new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere
you want.

Mary McCollum:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled Assault
at West Point, the Court Martial of Johnson Whittaker your mind will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in every single aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will end up your mind friends.
Imaging just about every word written in a reserve then become one type conclusion and explanation in
which maybe you never get just before. The Assault at West Point, the Court Martial of Johnson Whittaker
giving you an additional experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful details for
your better life with this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will
likely be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this
extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Hannah Norton:

The book untitled Assault at West Point, the Court Martial of Johnson Whittaker contain a lot of information
on this. The writer explains the girl idea with easy technique. The language is very simple to implement all
the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous author.
The author will bring you in the new period of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can
keep reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you
want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice learn.

Robert Ryan:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we would like. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year
has been exactly added. This reserve Assault at West Point, the Court Martial of Johnson Whittaker was
filled concerning science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific research
competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading a book. If you know how big selling point of a
book, you can experience enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book
you wanted.
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