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This fully updated Second Edition provides the reader with the solid understanding of tribology which is
essential to engineers involved in the design of, and ensuring the reliability of, machine parts and systems. It
moves from basic theory to practice, examining tribology from the integrated viewpoint of mechanical
engineering, mechanics, and materials science. It offers detailed coverage of the mechanisms of material
wear, friction, and all of the major lubrication techniques - liquids, solids, and gases - and examines a wide
range of both traditional and state-of-the-art applications.

For this edition, the author has included updates on friction, wear and lubrication, as well as completely
revised material including the latest breakthroughs in tribology at the nano- and micro- level and a revised
introduction to nanotechnology. Also included is a new chapter on the emerging field of green tribology and
biomimetics.
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From reader reviews:

Toni Styer:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
book has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you should have this Principles and Applications of Tribology.

Megan Snyder:

Why? Because this Principles and Applications of Tribology is an unordinary book that the inside of the
guide waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will distress you with the secret the idea inside. Reading
this book next to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such wonderful way makes the content
on the inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good
for you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This book will give you a
lot of advantages than the other book have such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking
approach. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-book store
hurriedly.

Kathi Adamo:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its include may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer might be Principles and Applications of Tribology why because the
fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or
content is fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this
book.

Aurora Ammon:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got students? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. So you know that
little person including reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that reading is very
important and book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except your
current teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update regarding something by book. Different categories
of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is Principles and Applications of Tribology.
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